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INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY (IT) APPROVED COURSES

Certified Cloud Professional (Starting February 27, 2023)
Cloud technology is important for developing a career in today’s computing landscape.
Cloud computing is quickly capturing the technological domain with notable players
such as Google and Amazon Web Services (AWS) making huge strides. As a result,
the demand for cloud professionals is also increasing considerably. There are
thousands of open tech jobs in the Tampa Bay area alone. This course will prepare
you to enter the exciting field of cloud computing. As a part of this course, you will
have the opportunity to take three different cloud certifications CompTIA Cloud
Essentials, AWS Certified Cloud Practitioner, and Google Associate Cloud Engineer. 

This course is designed for entry-level individuals looking to start a new career in IT.
This fundamental program begins with a brief introduction to PC basics; secondly, the
instructor will focus on the conceptual and practical aspects of both CompTIA A+ 220-
1001 and 220-1002 exam objectives, and lastly, the instructor will integrate the
program with job readiness skills to prepare participants to seek or obtain employment
and to keep their jobs once they are hired.

CompTIA A+ (Starting February 6, 2023)

Security+ course’s importance is growing as the frequency and severity of security
threats continue to be a major concern for organizations all over the world. Learn the
science behind how networks work. How bits travel across the world over the internet
from one machine to another. Learn about routers, switches, protocols, and security
measures to help take your skills to the next level. Network+ certification validates the
essential knowledge and skills needed to confidently design, configure, manage, and
troubleshoot any wired and wireless networks.

CompTIA Security+ (Starting January 24, 2023)

CompTIA Network+ (Starting March 21, 2023)
Network+ is a vendor-neutral technology certification used to measure the IT
Professional skills and knowledge needed to take on a pivotal role in building,
managing, and protecting critical assets of the data network. According to CompTIA,
the Network+ validates the skills to design, manage and troubleshoot any wired and
wireless devices. Although not required; it is recommended for individuals with a
CompTIA A+ Certification and nine months of networking experience. 

https://certification.comptia.org/certifications/network

